

**Daily & Woods, P.L.L.C.**

P.O. Box 1446  
Fort Smith, Arkansas 72902

(479) 782-0361

Federal ID No. 71-0042030

CITY OF FORT SMITH  
PO Box 1908  
Fort Smith, AR 72902

March 7, 2014

Inv #: 215346  
Matter: City-General

**RE:** General Legal Services

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>AMOUNT</b>	<b>TMKPR</b>
Feb-03-14	Re: Human Resources. Phone conference with Mr. Richard Jones regarding Civil Service rules	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	WRW
	Re: Civil Service. Telephone conference with Attorney Wade	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Telephone conference with Mr. Jones; telephone conference with Chief Lindsey	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	DMC
	Re: Samspon v. City (EEOC). Telephone call from Captain Copeland	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	DMC
Feb-04-14	Re: Entmeier v. City. Received and reviewed e-mail from City Administrator Gosack; phone conference with City Administrator Gosack	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	WRW
	Re: Agenda Items. Attend board of directors meeting	1.40	\$140.00	196.00	JLC
	Re: Court Street. Memo from and memo to Ms. Hughes	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: Addisen Entmeier v. City. Review correspondence from Mr. Gosack and Director Catsavis	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	DMC
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Telephone conference with Mr. Jones; telephone conference with Chief Lindsey	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	DMC
	Re: Sampson v. City (EEOC). Telephone call from Captain Copeland	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	DMC
Feb-05-14	Re: Fire Department. Received and reviewed e-mail from Chief Mike Richards regarding	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW

	report (MeGhee); phone conference with Attorney Kannett; phone conference with Chief Richards				
	Re: Bales v. City. Received and reviewed e-mail from Mr. Richard Jones regarding letter from Attorney Campbell to EEOC with Officer Sampson's demand; phone conference with Mr. Jones	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	WRW
	Re: RREF RB SBL v. City. Phone conference with Attorney Magness	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: HOME/Rivera. Review real estate research and file; letter to Attorney Martin-Herron	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	RRB
	RE: HOME/Hilburn. Review real estate research and file; letter to Attorney Dyke	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	RRB
	Re: Sampson v. City (EEOC). Two telephone conferences with Mr. Jones; receive and study correspondence and submissions relating to EEOC claim (8 pages single-spaced)	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	DMC
Feb-06-14	Re: Bales and Sampson v. McCabe. Phone conference with Officer Lee McCabe; phone call to Mr. Richard Jones; phone conference with Detective Smithson; office conference with Captain Copeland and Detective Smithson; received Complaint and summons; opened file	1.60	\$140.00	224.00	WRW
Feb-07-14	Re: Bales and Sampson v. McCabe. Phone conference with Mr. Richard Jones; office conference with Chief Lindsey, Mr. Jones, and Attorney Carson regarding employment issues; received and reviewed e-mails from Mr. Jones; phone conference with City Administrator Gosack	2.60	\$140.00	364.00	WRW
	Re: Fire Department. Received and reviewed e-mail from Chief Richards regarding request for report; phone conference with Attorney Kannett regarding same; phone conference with Chief Richards	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW
	Re: Civil Service. Received and reviewed e-mail from Mr. Richard Jones regarding proposed rule change; phone conference with Mr. Jones regarding same; worked on proposed revisions to Civil Service rules	1.50	\$140.00	210.00	WRW
	Re: Whirlpool. Memos from board members	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: CDBG. Email from Mr. Jennings; telephone call with Mr. Jennings	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	RRB

	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Office conference with Chief Lindsey, Mr. Jones, and Attorney Wade; telephone conference with Mr. Gosack; review documents	1.60	\$140.00	224.00	DMC
	Re: Sampson v. City (EEOC). Receive and study correspondence from Attorney Campbell re EEOC proceedings and claims; telephone conference with Mr. Jones	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	DMC
Feb-08-14	Re: Police Department Litigation. Conference with Attorney Wade regarding new defamation suit	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	JLC
	Re: Legislation. Memo from Mr. Gosack regarding legislative priorities	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
Feb-10-14	Re: RREP RB SBL. Received and reviewed letter from Judge Cox regarding summary judgment hearing; phone conference with Judge Cox's office regarding same	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	WRW
	Re: Bales and Sampson v. McCabe. Continued to work on letter to City Administrator Gosack regarding legal representation; phone conference with Attorney Campbell's office; phone conference with Captain Copeland; received and reviewed e-mail from Mr. Gosack	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	WRW
	Re: Civil Service Commission. Continued to work on proposed revisions to Rule 14:01; phone conference with Richard Jones regarding same; e-mail to Mr. Jones	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW
	Re: Nuisance. Legal research regarding ordinance directing abatement of nuisance	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Whirlpool. Telephone conference with Mr. Gosack; conferences with Attorney Wade	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	JLC
	Re: Civil Service. Review proposal rules; conference with Attorney Wade	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: Planning. Telephone conference with Mr. Bailey regarding meeting and ordinance; memo from Mr. Bailey; proofread and amend ordinance	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	JLC
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Telephone conference with Captain Copeland	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	DMC
	Re: Addisen Entmeier v. City. Letter from Chief Lindsey; receive and study related correspondence from Attorney Campbell	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	DMC
Feb-11-14	Re: Emergency Repairs. Telephone conference with Attorney Gant; telephone conference with Engineer Snodgrass; telephone conference with Mr. Parke	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	JLC

	Re: Agenda Items. Review and approve items	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: Whirlpool. Telephone conferences with Mr. Gosack; attend board of director's agenda meeting; conferences with Attorney Wade; memo to Mr. Gosack; telephone conference with Attorney Jones; legal research	2.10	\$140.00	294.00	JLC
	Re: CDBG. Review and approve execution of agreement with Crawford Sebastian Community Development Counsel	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	JLC
	Re: Property Owners. Memo from city clerk; conference with Attorney Wade	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: CDBG. Conference with Mr. Jennings and Mr. Smith regarding several files; exchange emails with Mr. Jennings	1.80	\$140.00	252.00	RRB
	Re: CDBG/Williams. Review file; research assessment records; memo to paralegal assistant regarding research	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	RRB
	Re: CDBG/Hart. Review file; research assessment records; memo to paralegal assistant regarding research	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	RRB
	Re: CDBG/Craine. Review file; research assessment records; memo to paralegal assistant regarding research	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	RRB
	Re: CDBG/Cole. Review file; research assessment records; letter to Mr. Jennings	0.60	\$140.00	84.00	RRB
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Review pleadings; legal research; prepare for and meet with Mr. and Mrs. McCabe	3.20	\$140.00	448.00	DMC
Feb-12-14	Re: City Clerk. Received and reviewed e-mail from Clerk Gard regarding amendment to property owners appeal board; legal research regarding same; phone conference with Clerk Gard	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Phone conference with City Administrator Gosack regarding representation of Ms. McCabe; received and reviewed memo from Mr. Gosack regarding same; phone conference with Chief Lindsey (2); office conference with Angela and Lee McCabe and Attorney Carson	2.90	\$140.00	406.00	WRW
	Re: Whirlpool. Legal research regarding littering ordinance and statute of limitations and regarding prior municipal lawsuits involving contaminated sites	1.30	\$140.00	182.00	WRW
	Re: RREF RB SBL v. City (1001 North 37th Street). Received and reviewed Amended	0.60	\$140.00	84.00	WRW

Answer and Brief in Response of AZ Paving to  
Motion for Summary Judgment

	Re: Bales and Sampson. Phone conference with Circuit Court Clerk regarding proof of service; phone conference with Captain Copeland (2); phone conference with Mr. Richard Jones (2); phone conference with City Administrator Gosack; received and reviewed e-mail from Mr. Jones	1.50	\$140.00	210.00	WRW
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Phone conference with Captain Copeland; received Ms. McCabe's personnel file and Mr. Jones' decision regarding her grievance	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW
	Re: Lien - North 50th. Receive notices of foreclosure; letter to city clerk	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: Whirlpool. Telephone conference with Mr. Settle; review opinions; dictate letter to Mr. Gosack; telephone conference with Mr. Gosack	2.30	\$140.00	322.00	JLC
	Re: HOME/Veach. Receive and review email and foreclosure documents from Mr. Jennings; email to Mr. Jennings; open file; research assessment records; work on draft of Answer to Complaint for Foreclosure; letter to Clerk	1.30	\$140.00	182.00	RRB
	Re: Whirlpool. Shepardize cases for Attorney Canfield	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	CTR
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Confer with Attorney Wade; prepare for and meet with Mr. and Mrs. McCabe	1.40	\$140.00	196.00	DMC
	Re: Bales v. City. Conference with Captain Copeland; review documents	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	DMC
Feb-13-14	Re: Agenda Items. Approve multiple agenda items	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	JLC
	Re: Planning. Telephone conference with Mr. Bailey regarding annexation maps; memo from Mr. Bailey	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	JLC
	Re: Whirlpool. Telephone conference with Attorney Settle; telephone conference with Mr. Gosack; review memo and responses to board; memo regarding litter citations; telephone conference with Mr. Gosack; complete letter and deliver to Mr. Gosack	1.60	\$140.00	224.00	JLC
	Re: Bales and Sampson. Edited proposed Motion to Dismiss and Supporting Brief; legal research regarding same; phone conference with Mr. Richard Jones; letter to Captain	2.90	\$140.00	406.00	WRW

	Jarrard Copeland regarding filing of Motion to Dismiss				
	Re: Parks and Recreation. Reviewed e-mail from Mr. Mike Alsup with proposed lease for NHS softball ads; phone conference with Clerk Gard; phone conference with Mr. Ken Savage; received and reviewed advertising regulations for transit system; phone conference with Mr. Mike Alsup	1.50	\$140.00	210.00	WRW
	Re: City Clerk. Phone conference with Clerk Gard regarding property owners' appeal board	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Fire Department. Phone conference with Chief Richards regarding FOIA request	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: CDBG/LAH. Telephone call with Attorney Self; telephone call with Mr. Jennings; telephone call with Mr. Jennings; telephone call with Mr. Bailey; telephone call with Attorney Self	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	RRB
	Re: HOME/Veach. Proofread and revise Answer; receive and review email from Mr. Jennings with payoff amount; update file	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	RRB
	Re: Phillip Taylor. Review file; letter to Attorney Taylor; receive and begin review of Appellant's Brief; telephone call with Ms. Gard	1.60	\$140.00	224.00	RRB
	Re: RAM Outdoor. Review file; telephone call with Mr. Bailey; telephone call with Attorney Gaston; letter to Circuit Clerk	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	RRB
	Re: Bales v. City. Legal research; draft and edit motion to dismiss (5 pages) and brief in support of motion to dismiss (5 pages); telephone conference with Mr. Jones; letter to Mr. Jones	7.20	\$140.00	1,008.00	DMC
Feb-14-14	Re: HOME/Ramos. Receive and review letter from Attorney Smith; review file; letter to Mr. Jennings	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	RRB
	Re: City Clerk. Received and reviewed e-mail from Clerk Gard regarding property owners appeal board	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Agenda. Reviewed and approved proposed agenda item	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	WRW
	Re: FSPD. Received and reviewed e-mail from Mr. Richard Jones regarding Corporal Samson's EEOC complaint; phone conference with Mr. Jones regarding same	0.60	\$140.00	84.00	WRW
	Re: Agenda. Approve additional items; telephone conference with Mr. Gosack regarding legislative priorities	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	JLC

	Re: Whirlpool. Telephone conferences with Mr. Gosack; review information items regarding potential legal action	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	JLC
	Re: Bales v. City. Telephone conference with Mr. Jones; letter from Mr. Jones; telephone call from Attorney Campbell; letter from Attorney Campbell; telephone call to Attorney Campbell	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	DMC
	Re: Sampson v. City (EEOC). Telephone conference with Mr. Jones; receive and study EEOC file materials (10 pages)	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	DMC
	Re: Addisen Entmeier v. City. Review file information on service of process; telephone call to Attorney Campbell	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	DMC
Feb-15-14	Re: Whirlpool. Letter from Mr. Gosack with contingent fee agreement	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	JLC
Feb-17-14	Re: Whirlpool. Telephone conference with Mr. Gosack; review agreement and prepare list of changes; memo from Mr. Gosack; telephone conference with Mr. Gosack; conference with Attorney Roe in preparation for board meeting; memos from Attorney Sims and Mr. Gosack	1.70	\$140.00	238.00	JLC
	Re: Transit. Review and approve annual assurances; deliver to Mr. Gosack	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	JLC
	Re: Class Action. Receive notice; memo to Mr. Gosack and Ms. Bushkuhl	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	JLC
	Re: Human Resources. Phone conference with Mr. Richard Jones regarding procedure for amending Civil Service rules; legal research regarding same	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	WRW
	Re: City Administrator. Legal research regarding appropriation of funds for private persons	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW
	Re: RAM Outdoor Advertising. Telephone call with Attorney Gaston; conference with Mr. Bailey and Mr. Dingham; telephone call with Attorney Gaston; letter from Attorney Gaston; letter to Judge Fitzhugh	1.00	\$140.00	140.00	RRB
	Re: CDBG/LAH. Review file; prepare for conference; conference with Mr. Dingham, Mr. Jennings, Mr. Bailey, Mr. Smith, Rev. Washington, and Attorney Self	1.50	\$140.00	210.00	RRB
	Re: Phillip Taylor. Telephone call with Attorney Taylor	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	RRB

	Re: Whirlpool. Conference with Attorneys Wade and Canfield regarding contingency agreement with Attorney Sims; telephone conference with Mr. Gosack; review opinions previously issued to City	1.70	\$140.00	238.00	CTR
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Review and analyze complaint; office conference with Ms. McCabe	1.60	\$140.00	224.00	DMC
	Re: Addisen Entmeier v. City. Letter from Attorney Campbell; telephone conference with Attorney Campbell; letter to Attorney Campbell	0.60	\$140.00	84.00	DMC
Feb-18-14	Re: Berry v. Davis. Reviewed appeal brief of Plaintiff; office conference with Attorney Roe regarding appeal strategy; letter to Captain Copeland regarding Appellee's Brief	1.60	\$140.00	224.00	WRW
	Re: Bales and Sampson. Received and reviewed e-mail from City Administrator Gosack regarding pending motion to dismiss; received and reviewed Plaintiff's Reply Brief	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	WRW
	Re: City Prosecutor. Exchanged e-mails with City Prosecutor's office regarding August prosecution	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Agenda. Reviewed and approved proposed Ordinance regarding annexation; phone conference with Clerk Gard regarding same	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	WRW
	Re: Phillip Taylor. Letter to Attorney Taylor; review Appellant's Brief and Abstract	2.60	\$140.00	364.00	RRB
	Re: RAM Outdoor. Telephone call with Judge Fitzhugh's office; letter to Attorney Gaston; receive and review documents from Clerk; update file	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	RRB
	Re: HOME/Barillas. Receive and review email and foreclosure documents from Mr. Jennings; open file; research assessment records; conference with paralegal assistant regarding real estate research	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	RRB
	Re: HOME/Misc. Receive and review deed restriction form and email from Mr. Jennings; revise deed restriction form; email to Mr. Jennings	1.10	\$140.00	154.00	RRB
	Re: Berry. Receive and review of appellees' brief; conference with Attorney Wade; print cases cited in appellees' brief	1.40	\$140.00	196.00	CTR
	Re: Whirlpool. Review ordinances regarding nuisance; research and prepare for board meeting; telephone conference with Mr. Ray Gosack	1.10	\$140.00	154.00	CTR



	Re: Agenda. Attend board of directors meeting	0.60	\$140.00	84.00	CTR
	Re: Bales v. City. Receive and study requests for admission to defendant Copeland; letter from Attorney Campbell; receive and study response and brief opposing City's motion to dismiss (36 pages); telephone conference with Mr. Jones	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	DMC
Feb-19-14	RE: HOME/Misc. Email from Mr. Jennings regarding deed restriction form issue	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	RRB
	Re: Whirlpool. Phone conference with Channel 5 reporter	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	WRW
	Re: FSPD. Phone conference with Chief Lindsey regarding subgrant award (2); received and reviewed grant documents	1.30	\$140.00	182.00	WRW
	Re: Bales v. City. Office conference with Attorney Carson regarding strategy	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	WRW
	Re: Bales v. City. Telephone conference with Captain Copeland; letter to Captain Copeland; letter from Captain Copeland; review discovery requests to various defendants; file review re discovery responses; conference with Attorney Wade; draft responses to requests for admissions; two telephone conferences with Chief Lindsey; office conference with Chief Lindsey	3.20	\$140.00	448.00	DMC
Feb-20-14	Re: Bales v. City. Office conference with Chief Lindsey; phone conference with Court Reporter Bland	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	WRW
	Re: HOME/Misc. Exchange emails with Mr. Jennings	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	RRB
	Re: RAM Outdoor. Telephone call with Mr. Bailey	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	RRB
	Re: Berry. Begin drafting reply brief	2.20	\$140.00	308.00	CTR
	Re: Addisen Entmeier v. City. Draft and edit motion to dismiss and supporting brief (12 pages)	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	DMC
	Re: Bales v. City. Telephone call to Circuit Clerk; further draft and revise responses and objections to requests for admissions; telephone conference with Chief Lindsey; office conference with Chief Lindsey; telephone conference with Attorney Campbell; letter to Attorney Campbell	2.60	\$140.00	364.00	DMC
Feb-21-14	Re: Berry. Continue drafting reply brief	2.40	\$140.00	336.00	CTR

	Re: Bales. Conference with Attorney Carson regarding motion to dismiss	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	WRW
	Re: Court Street. Received and reviewed e-mail from Ms. Jayne Hughes regarding Court Street	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	WRW
	Re: Administration. Conference with Mayor Sanders regarding City's bicentennial celebration	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	WRW
	Re: Bales v. City. Confer with Chief Lindsey re discovery responses; draft and edit responses to interrogatories; draft and edit responses to requests for documents; two letters from Attorney Campbell; telephone call to Attorney Campbell; two letters to Attorney Campbell	3.60	\$140.00	504.00	DMC
	Re: Addisen Entmeier v. City. Confer with Chief Lindsey; further draft and edit motion to dismiss and supporting brief; review Circuit Clerk's file; letter to Attorney Campbell	1.20	\$140.00	168.00	DMC
Feb-24-14	Re: Police Department. Exchanged e-mails with Corporal Patricia Sullivan regarding MOU with Arkansas State Police (2); reviewed and revised proposed Resolution regarding same	0.60	\$140.00	84.00	WRW
	Re: City Administrator. Received and reviewed e-mail from Deputy City Administrator Dingman regarding construction manager deducts	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Berry v. Davis. Edited Reply Brief	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW
	Re: CDBG/Williams. Review file and real estate research; letter to Ms. Williams	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	RRB
	Re: CDBG/Hart. Review file and real estate research; letter to Ms. Hart	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	RRB
	Re: CDBG/Craigne. Review file and real estate research; conference with paralegal assistant regarding additional research	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	RRB
	Re: HOME/Barillas. Review file and real estate research; letter to Attorney Martin-Herron	0.60	\$140.00	84.00	RRB
	Re: Berry. Continue drafting and revising reply brief; research federal caselaw regarding qualified immunity in excessive force cases	6.50	\$140.00	910.00	CTR
	Re: Bales v. City. Letter from Attorney Campbell; confer with Attorney Wade; receive and study amended response and brief opposing motion to dismiss (37 pages)	1.00	\$140.00	140.00	DMC

	Re: Sampson v. City (EEOC). Letter from Mr. Jones; receive and study 7 pages of correspondence re EEOC claim; telephone call to Mr. Jones	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	DMC
Feb-25-14	Re: Bales v. City. Received and reviewed e-mail from Deputy City Administrator Dingman regarding FOIA request for attorney information; received and reviewed e-mail from Ms. Christy Deuster in response to Attorney Campbell's FOIA requests; phone conference with City Administrator Gosack	1.40	\$140.00	196.00	WRW
	Re: McCabe v. City. Received and reviewed e-mail from City Administrator Gosack regarding FOIA request	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Deutsch Bank v. City (917 South 22nd). Received and reviewed copy of Foreclosure Decree; letter to Clerk Gard regarding same; closed file	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	WRW
	Re: Purchasing. Received and reviewed e-mail from Deputy City Administrator Dingman regarding local preference for bidders; legal research regarding same; phone conference with Deputy Administrator Dingman	1.80	\$140.00	252.00	WRW
	Re: Berry v. Davis. Continued editing appeal Reply Brief	1.70	\$140.00	238.00	WRW
	Re: Engineering (Project 12-06-C2). Reviewed and approved contract	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	WRW
	Re: Utilities (Project 12-17-C2). Reviewed and approved contract	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	WRW
	Re: Berry. Continue drafting and revising reply brief	1.90	\$140.00	266.00	CTR
	Re: Sampson v. City (EEOC). Telephone conference with Mr. Jones re response to Mr. Sampson's EEOC charge; review correspondence from EEOC; receive and study document packet (approx. 1 1/2 " thick)	0.80	\$140.00	112.00	DMC
	Re: FOIA Requests. Receive and study Attorney Campbell's FOIA request re information concerning City Attorney appointment and billings and six letters from Mr. Gosack to Attorney Campbell with copies of City resolutions and other documentary evidence; receive and study Mr. Gosack's letter to Attorney Campbell re FOIA request; letter from Ms. Deuster; receive and study City's response to FOIA request; confer with Attorney Wade	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	DMC

	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Receive and study memorandum from Mr. Gosack re City's defense of Officer McCabe; receive and study correspondence from Mr. Gosack to City Directors; letter from Major Pitts	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	DMC
	Re: Bales v. City. Receive and study letter from Mr. Gosack to City Directors re response to lawsuit	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	DMC
Feb-26-14	Re: Berry. Continued editing appeal brief	3.20	\$140.00	448.00	WRW
	Re: Parks & Recreation. Received and reviewed e-mail from Mr. Mike Alsup regarding sports complex; phone conference with Mr. Alsup regarding same; phone conference with Attorney David Harp	0.70	\$140.00	98.00	WRW
	Re: Purchasing. Received and reviewed e-mails from City Administrator Gosack and Mr. Alie Bahsoon regarding preference for local suppliers; received and reviewed e-mail from Deputy Administrator Dingman regarding same	0.50	\$140.00	70.00	WRW
	Re: Sanitation. Received and reviewed e-mail from Ms. Stacy Vanourny regarding chapter 7 bankruptcy of Fortis Plastic; reviewed bankruptcy notice and City's invoice; phone conference with Ms. Vanourny regarding same	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	WRW
	Re: Berry. Continue revising reply brief	1.80	\$140.00	252.00	CTR
	Re: Bales v. City. Telephone conference with Chief Lindsey; office conference with Chief Lindsey; telephone call to Attorney Campbell; letter to Attorney Campbell	1.00	\$140.00	140.00	DMC
Feb-27-14	Re: Berry v. City. Continued to work on Reply Brief on appeal	2.10	\$140.00	294.00	WRW
	Re: Parks & Recreation. Phone conference with Attorney Keith Griffith regarding sports complex; phone conference with Mr. Mike Alsup	0.90	\$140.00	126.00	WRW
	Re: Sanitation. Received and reviewed e-mail from Ms. Vanourny regarding Exide Technology bankruptcy; phone conference with Mr. Bill Hon; phone conference with Mr. Allie Bahsoon; phone conference with Ms. Vanourny (2); reviewed bankruptcy filings	1.90	\$140.00	266.00	WRW
	Re: Agenda. Reviewed and approved proposed agenda items; phone conference with Clerk Gard	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	WRW

	Re: Police Department. Exchanged e-mails with Corporal Sullivan regarding MOU with Arkansas State Police	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Court Street. Phone call to Jayne Hughes	0.20	\$140.00	28.00	WRW
	Re: Bales v. City. Letter from Attorney Campbell; telephone call to Attorney Campbell	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	DMC
	Re: Bales v. McCabe. Review complaint; legal research	1.40	\$140.00	196.00	DMC
Feb-28-14	Re: Berry v. Davis. Continued to work on Reply Brief	1.80	\$140.00	252.00	WRW
	Re: Engineering. Reviewed and approved contracts for Mill Creek Pump Station, Project No. 10-01-C1	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	WRW
	Re: Court Street. Phone conference with Ms. Jayne Hughes	0.30	\$140.00	42.00	WRW
	Re: Agenda. Reviewed and approved proposed agenda item	0.10	\$140.00	14.00	WRW
	Re: Berry. Print and review U.S. Supreme Court case regarding co-tenants' authority to consent to search of home	0.40	\$140.00	56.00	CTR
	Total Fees	149.80		<u>\$20,972.00</u>	

**EXPENSES INCURRED:**

Feb-03-14	04576	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense Re: Agenda Items.	23.70
Feb-05-14	46410	Sebastian County Clerk	Re: HOME/Ramos. Copies at Clerk's office during January	7.75
	46410	Sebastian County Clerk	Re: HOME/Clark. Copies at Clerk's office during January	9.50
	46410	Sebastian County Clerk	Re: HOME/Valesquez. Copies at Clerk's office during January	8.00
	46410	Sebastian County Clerk	Re: HOME/Rivera. Copies at Clerk's office during January	0.25
	46410	Sebastian County Clerk	Re: CDBG. Copies at Clerk's office during January	2.00
Feb-07-14	04582	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - Bales & Sampson	6.00
Feb-10-14	04582	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - Bales & Sampson	2.40
Feb-12-14	04585	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - Whirlpool	16.20
Feb-13-14	46423	FedEx	Re: Berry. Shipments to 8th Circuit Court of Appeals and to Blades & Gee, PLLC	167.44
	04588	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - Bales and Sampson and Entmeier	17.20

	04588	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - Parks & Recreation	2.40
	04589	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense re Bales, et al. v. City	5.40
	04589	Expense Recovery	Postage Expense re Bales, et al. v. City	1.40
Feb-17-14	04591	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense Re: Agenda Items.	13.05
	04607	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense Re: RAM Outdoor	138.15
Feb-18-14	04592	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - Bales et al	6.20
	04594	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense Re: Berry.	12.30
	04607	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense Re: Phillip Taylor (copies of hearing transcript for appeal briefing)	7.20
Feb-19-14	04593	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - FSPD	4.80
Feb-24-14	AmEx	American Express	Re: Berry. PACER charges for 4th quarter 2013	36.10
Feb-25-14	04603	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense Re: Deutsche Bank v. City.	3.20
Feb-27-14	04599	Expense Recovery	Photocopy Expense - Berry v City	17.60
		Total Expenses		\$508.24
		<b>Total Fees &amp; Expenses</b>		<b>\$21,480.24</b>

**TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:**

			<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
CTR	Colby T. Roe	Partner	20.40	\$140.00	\$2,856.00
DMC	Douglas M. Carson	Partner	39.10	\$140.00	\$5,474.00
JLC	Jerry L. Canfield	Partner	13.40	\$140.00	\$1,876.00
RRB	Robert R. Briggs	Partner	21.70	\$140.00	\$3,038.00
WRW	Wyman R. Wade, Jr.	Partner	55.20	\$140.00	\$7,728.00